THE CORPORATION OF THE CITY OF NORTH BAY

BY-LAW NO, 85-97

BEING A BY-LAW TO AMEND THE WATER RATES BY-
LAW NO. 39-96 AND THE SEWAGE RATES BY-LAW 13-71.

WHEREAS By-Law No. 39-96 establishes rates for the supply of water in the City of
North Bay pursuant to the Public Utilities Act, and By-Law 13-71 establishes a sewer surcharge
rate;

AND WHEREAS it is deemed desirable to amend the said By-Laws to increase the
sewage rate to 106%, and to add a fixed rate to metered accounts and to correct a typographical

€rror.

THEREFORE THE COUNCIL OF THE CORPORATION OF THE CITY OF NORTH BY
HEREBY ENACTS AS FOLLOWS: '

1. (1) Section 3 of Schedule A of By-Law No. 39-96 is hereby amended by adding the
following words:

“a basic fixed rate of $ 1.00 per residential dwelling unit or commercial/industrial
account be added to all metered accounts.”

(2) Paragraph (a) of Section 8 of By-Law No. 39-96 is hereby deleted and the following
inserted in lieu thereof:

“Accounts for the rates or charges for the supply of water by flat rate shall be
payable by the consumer every four months with payment due in the month
following each such period.”

2. Section 2 of the Sewage Rates By-Law 13-71 is hereby amended by deleting “one

hundred and three percent”, and inserting in lieu thereof “one hundred and six percent”,
wherever it appears.

3. Section 7 (1) (a) of By-Law 39-96 is hereby amended by deleting “$.050" and inserting
“$0.50" in lieu thereof.

4. (1) Section 1 of this By-Law comes into effect as of and from July 1, 1997.
(2) Section 2 of this By-Law comes into effect as of and from April 1, 1997.

(3) Section 3 of this By-Law comes into effect as of and from April 1, 1996.

READ A FIRST TIME IN OPEN COUNCIL THE 2ND DAY OF SEPTEMBER, 1997.
READ A SECOND TIME IN OPEN COUNCIL THE 2ND DAY OF SEPTEMBER, 1997.

READ A THIRD TIME IN OPEN COUNCIL AND ENACTED AND PASSED THIS 2ND

/ 4(/@:1 {27

CITY CLERK

SEPTEMBER, 1997.




